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To: David Marwell/ARRBcc: From: Eric Scheinkopf/ARRB Date: 12/13/95 08:36:21 AMSubject: Library of 

Congress book Hoover and the Un-AmericansOn Tuesday, the 12th I received a call from Teena Siggers (707-

4630) at the Library of Congress regarding the book Hoover and the Un-Americans of which I spoke to you last 

month. She noted that there was extensive water damage and that they could not order a book from Books in 

Print to replace it and thus recommended a copy be made usingthere photoduplication service. She estimated 

the cost at $118. I think this is too great a sum to pay. Also I think we should fight it given that earlier they 

thought one book was not returned, Report to the President and the Secretary of Defense, when in fact it had 

been and it was only through my own search request that the book was found.I called Tenna today to tell he 

that we are in the midst of a board meeting and that we will be in touch. She appreciated the call back today. 

To: David Marwell/ARRBcc: From: Eric Scheinkopf/ARRB Date: 12/26/95 09:04:44 AMSubject: Library of 

Congress bookI spoke to Elgin Reid at the Library of Congress this morning and talked to him as you suggested. 

I indicated that we would sign a sworn statement saying that we did not damage the book, as if we believed 

we had damaged it we would be willing to pay. He said he is fairly confident that the book went out 

undamaged. He plans to contact the L of C's Office of Inspector General to see what the next step is on his 

end. I said we would wait to hear from him. To: David Marwell/ARRBcc: From: Eric Scheinkopf/ARRB Date: 

05/07/96 03:17:47 PMSubject: Library book replacementThis is a follow-up to our earlier conversation on the 

replacement of a book the Library of Congress says was damaged. I believe that unless I hear from any other 

sources by early next week that we accept the book that the Second Story Books Rockville Warehouse has. 

While it is $61 it is still much cheaper than the $118 the Library of Congress would charge. I also doubt we will 

find a cheaper version. If you okay this I will inform the Library of Congress that we have found a replacement. 

For your information, the Library of Congress has not inquired about the book since sending us an official 

notice on February 29, 1996 saying the book must be replaced. To: Tracy Shycoff/ARRBcc: From: David 

Marwell/ARRB Date: 05/07/96 04:48:27 PMSubject: Library book replacementCan we do this?To: David 

Marwell/ARRBcc: From: Eric Scheinkopf/ARRB Date: 05/07/96 03:17:47 PMSubject: Library book 

replacementThis is a follow-up to our earlier conversation on the replacement of a book the Library of 

Congress says was damaged. I believe that unless I hear from any other sources by early next week that we 

accept the book that the Second Story Books Rockville Warehouse has. While it is $61 it is still much cheaper 

than the $118 the Library of Congress would charge. I also doubt we will find a cheaper version. If you okay 

this I will inform the Library of Congress that we have found a replacement. For your information, the Library 
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