
NR_key_name: 6C7D345172452170852562AE005F1C75

SendTo: CN=Tom Samoluk/O=ARRB @ ARRB

CopyTo:

DisplayBlindCopyTo:

BlindCopyTo: CN=R ecord/O=ARRB

From: CN=Valerie Trzaska-Sails/O=ARRB

DisplayFromDomain:

DisplayDate: 01/11/1996

DisplayDate_Time: 12:24:29 PM

ComposedDate: 01/11/1996

ComposedDate_Time: 12:18:52 PM

Subject: Re: Hopper/Jenkins Reimbursement

Body:

Yes, I received their signed paperwork on 12/18/95 and I submitted the paperwork for payment on 12/19/95.  

They should receive a check by 1/19-20/96.  Thanks for your help and have a nice weekend. To:	Valerie 

Trzaska-Sails/ARRBcc:	 From:	Tom Samoluk/ARRB   Date:	01/05/96 12:40:25 PMSubject:	Hopper/Jenkins 

ReimbursementVal - I was curious if  Delores Hopper and Larry Jenkins sent back the signed paperwork 

required of them and if that is in the pipeline.  Please advise.  Thanks.  (No rush; just want to make sure they 

are taken care of for the next time I talk to them.) 
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