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139386DB07CB81618525666A004357A0
CN=R ecord/O=ARRB @ ARRB

CN=R ecord/O=ARRB
CN=Chet Rhodes/O=ARRB

08/24/1998
8:15:31 AM
08/24/1998
8:15:26 AM
Re: donation

To: Tracy Shycoff/ARRBcc: (bcc: Non-Record/ARRB)From: Eileen Sullivan/ARRBDate: 08/11/98 09:40:44
AMSubject: Re: donationlooks good to me. Seems like he is dragging his feet on this one -- this letter may
spark something.To: Laura Denk/ARRB, Eileen Sullivan/ARRBcc: From: Tracy Shycoff/ARRB Date: 08/11/98
08:59:22 AMSubject: donationl would like your permission to send this note to David Lifton and any input that
you might have on it. Thanks.To: dlifton @ compuserve.com @ internet @ interliantcc: eileen, laura From:
Tracy Shycoff/ARRB Date: 08/11/98 08:44:50 AMSubject: donationMr. Lifton:l am writing to check on the
progress of your donation to the JFK collection. | understand that Mr. Pat Valentino (Future Perfect Digital) is
dubbing the tapes and last August we agreed to pay $1500 towards the cost of this work. As you know, the
ARRB is in the final stages of operation and we are busy closing out accounts. Can you please give me the date
that we can expect the tapes from you? Obviously, the sooner we receive the tapes and the bill for services
from Future Perfect Digital the better. If we do not receive the materials by the first of September, we will
have to reexamine the situation and make a decision as to whether we can continue to wait and pay for the
donation.Thank you for your attention to this matter. We look forward to receiving the donation from
you.Sincerely,Tracy J. ShycoffDeputy Director
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